
SIA "City Real Estate" "Swedbank" AS 8-2 Bruninieku Str. Phone: 67114284 www.cityreal.lv
Reg.no.: 40003820580 LV80HABA0551013020827 Riga, LV-1010 GSM: 22333336 city@cityreal.lv

Apartment for rent in Riga, Kengarags, Latgales street

Courtyard  building,  well-maintained  greened  plot  of  land,  the
parking  in  courtyard  for  free,  in  a  courtyard  is  available
playground , staircase after decoration , balcony, windows are
located on the park side, wide view from the window, one room
isolated, studio type apartment, central heating system, plastic
glass windows, outside doors made from steel, laminate flooring,
bathroom with WC, shower stall,  build in kitchen unit,  built-in
wardrobe,  double  bed,  table,  chairs,  single  reclining  chair,
wardrobe,  refrigerator,  electric  range, oven,  washing machine,
staircase doors under seven seals, for rent with all in pictures
visible  equipment,  for  one  year,  possibility  to  extend  lease
agreement, available from october, till river 200 m, strategically
beneficial location, till school 150 m, till kindergarten 100 m, till
shop 100 m, till supermarket 500 m, till tram stop 100 m, without
animals, by signing rental agreement you have to pay for the first
rent month as well as you have to pay guaranty deposit which is
equal one month rent payment, if you choose this real estate,
you have to pay agency transaction commission which is equal
with one half (50%) of this real estate month rental payment,
CITY REAL ESTATE ID - 516783

 

ID: 516783
Type: Apartment

Subtype: New lithuanian
project

Price: 350.00 EUR
Price m2: 9.46 EUR
Area: 37.00 m2

Rooms: 2
Floor: 5 from 5
Renovation: full
Comfort: full
Furniture: full

Contacts:
Ingrīda Punka, +371 27065510, ingrida@cityreal.lv


